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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Meter & Valve Box Components

TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 15, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Group 1 RECTANGULAR METER BOXES AND TRAFFIC BEARING STEEL LIDS UNIT      
400 ea. PRICE 50.00 53.25 52.64 51.75 51.75

1. #2 Meter Box (SAWS #9858) TOTAL 20,000.00 21,300.00 21,056.00 20,700.00 20,700.00
300 ea.          UNIT

No. 1 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13581) (Lids will be marked with SAWS water jet cut in PRICE 80.00 111.50 110.52 107.00 107.00
2. 2" block letter at 1/2 depth) TOTAL 24,000.00 33,450.00 33,156.00 32,100.00 32,100.00

500 ea. UNIT

No. 2 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13582) (Lids will be marked with SAWS water jet cut in PRICE 125.00 131.50 131.58 128.00 128.00
3. 2" block letter at 1/2 depth) TOTAL 62,500.00 65,750.00 65,790.00 64,000.00 64,000.00

  *

  

 TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 106,500.00 120,500.00 120,002.00 116,800.00 116,800.00

Group 2 OVAL METER BOXES UNIT      

3,300 ea. PRICE 30.61 31.89 31.86 31.35 31.35

1. Oval Meter Box (SAWS #9853) TOTAL 101,013.00 105,237.00 105,138.00 103,455.00 103,455.00

UNIT

5,000 ea. PRICE 28.43 29.63 29.60 29.13 29.13

2. Oval Lid (SAWS #13577) TOTAL 142,150.00 148,150.00 148,000.00 145,650.00 145,650.00

   *

   

 TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 243,163.00 253,387.00 253,138.00 249,105.00 249,105.00

Group 3 VALVE BOX COMPONENTS UNIT

 350 ea. PRICE 26.00 31.85 27.12 NO BID 26.91 26.91

1. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS #9877) TOTAL 9,100.00 11,147.50 9,492.00  9,418.50 9,418.50

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 8.75 11.05 9.12 NO BID 8.18 8.18

2. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS#10273) TOTAL 5,250.00 6,630.00 5,472.00  4,908.00 4,908.00

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 15.00 18.88 15.64 NO BID 15.53 15.53

3. 9" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 9" (SAWS #9833) TOTAL 9,000.00 11,328.00 9,384.00  9,318.00 9,318.00

UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 26.00 27.75 27.06 NO BID 21.74 21.74

4. 15" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 15"  (SAWS #9834) TOTAL 3,900.00 4,162.50 4,059.00  3,261.00 3,261.00

UNIT

20 ea. PRICE 20.07 20.75 15.96 NO BID 15.53 15.53

5. Valve Box cap, size 6" Division (SAWS #10270) TOTAL 401.40 415.00 319.20  310.60 310.60

UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 10.50 11.25 10.92 NO BID 10.87 10.87

6. Valve Box cap, Size 6" Open Left (SAWS #10271) TOTAL 1,575.00 1,687.50 1,638.00  1,630.50 1,630.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 20.07 20.75 22.64 NO BID 15.53 15.53

7. Valve Box cap, size 6" Open Right (SAWS #10272) TOTAL 2,007.00 2,075.00 2,264.00  1,553.00 1,553.00

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 41.00 46.25 45.82 NO BID 42.44 42.44

8. 10" Monument Box Traffic bearing sewer cleanout DI  (SAWS #15893) TOTAL 12,300.00 13,875.00 13,746.00  12,732.00 12,732.00

 *

 

TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 43,533.40 51,320.50 46,374.20 NO BID 43,131.60 43,131.60

Group 4 TRAFFIC BEARING COMPOSITE LIDS UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 28.23 NO BID 27.44

1a. No. 2 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic bearing, Mfg: Nicor; P/N 15X25WNL (SAWS #38978) TOTAL 28,230.00  27,440.00

1,000 ea. UNIT

No. 2 Meter Box frame 1/4" X 2" X 2" Angle 1-1/2 X 2" Flat Bar, Mfg: Nicor; P/N PRICE 88.76 NO BID 132.84

1b. B16BLKHDS-SAWS (frame will be marked with SAWS stamped in 1" block letter) (SAWS #43880) TOTAL 88,760.00  132,840.00

UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 18.60 NO BID 18.07

2a. No. 1 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic Bearing, Mfg: Nicor; P/N 12X18WNL (SAWS #38979) TOTAL 11,160.00  10,842.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Meter & Valve Box Components

TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 15, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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600 ea. UNIT

No. 1 Meter Box Frame 1/4" X 1/2" X 1/2" Angle 1/2" X 1/4" Flat Bar 1/2" X 1" Flat Bar PRICE 88.76 NO BID 122.78

2b.

Mfg: Nicor; P/N B9BLKHDS-SAWS (frame will be marked with SAWS stamped in 1" block letter

(SAWS #38979) TOTAL 53,256.00  73,668.00

*

TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 181,406.00 NO BID 244,790.00

Group 5 INCIDENTAL TRAFFIC BEARING COMPOSITE LIDS UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 62.44 65.07 64.38 63.98 63.98

1.

No. 2 Meter Box Lid Polymer, Traffic bearing incidental Mfg: DFW Plastic, P/N DFWMB17821-1A

SAWS-LID   (SAWS #39028) TOTAL 156,100.00 162,675.00 160,950.00 159,950.00 159,950.00

*

TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 156,100.00 162,675.00 160,950.00 159,950.00 159,950.00

TOTAL AWARD TOTAL 1,374,338.00 86,263.20

   

 EXTENSION 1  687,169.00 43,131.60

ESTENSION 2 687,169.00 43,181.60

EXTENSION 3 687,169.00 43,181.60

EXTENSION 4 687,169.00 43,181.60

Net Net 2% Net 2% 2%

 Terms 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 10 days 10 days

Delivery 7-14 days 3-8 days 21 days 30 days 21 days 21 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Act Pipe & Supply Demandstar

Corix SAWS Website

Ferguson Water Works

Fortiline Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks

Hydro Pro Solutions

Master Tech Line Pipe

Morrison Supply
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